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Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday

1

Sun AM Bible Study
9:15am - 10:05am

Sun AM Worship
10:15am - 11:45am

2 3 4

Wed PM Bible Study
7:00pm - 8:00pm

5 6 7

8

Sun AM Bible Study
9:15am - 10:05am

Sun AM Worship
10:15am - 11:45am

9 10 11

Wed PM Bible Study
7:00pm - 8:00pm

12 13 14

15

Sun AM Bible Study
9:15am - 10:05am

Sun AM Worship
10:15am - 11:45am

16 17 18

Services Cancelled
12:30pm - 3:25pm
Due to the
recommendations
from the CDC and the
city of Chattanooga to
prevent the spread of
coronavirus and to
protect our members
services for the
foreseeable future
have been cancelled.
As soon as possible
we will resume
worship services.
Please check back
prior to services to
verify if services have
been cancelled or not.
If you are in doubt
please submit a
question. Please join
us for a Bible Moment
on our Facebook page
beginning at 10:15am
on Sundays and 7pm
on Wednesdays. You
can also join us for a
Bible Study on Zoom
at 9:30am on Sunday
and around 7:30pm
on Wednesday. You
will need the emailed
meeting id and
password to join.

Wed PM Bible Study
7:00pm - 8:00pm

19 20 21

22

Sun AM Bible Study

23 24 25

Services Cancelled

26 27 28
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9:15am - 10:05am

Sun AM Worship
10:15am - 11:45am

Services Cancelled
12:30pm - 3:25pm
Due to the
recommendations
from the CDC and the
city of Chattanooga to
prevent the spread of
coronavirus and to
protect our members
services for the
foreseeable future
have been cancelled.
As soon as possible
we will resume
worship services.
Please check back
prior to services to
verify if services have
been cancelled or not.
If you are in doubt
please submit a
question. Please join
us for a Bible Moment
on our Facebook page
beginning at 10:15am
on Sundays and 7pm
on Wednesdays. You
can also join us for a
Bible Study on Zoom
at 9:30am on Sunday
and around 7:30pm
on Wednesday. You
will need the emailed
meeting id and
password to join.

12:30pm - 3:25pm
Due to the
recommendations
from the CDC and the
city of Chattanooga to
prevent the spread of
coronavirus and to
protect our members
services for the
foreseeable future
have been cancelled.
As soon as possible
we will resume
worship services.
Please check back
prior to services to
verify if services have
been cancelled or not.
If you are in doubt
please submit a
question. Please join
us for a Bible Moment
on our Facebook page
beginning at 10:15am
on Sundays and 7pm
on Wednesdays. You
can also join us for a
Bible Study on Zoom
at 9:30am on Sunday
and around 7:30pm
on Wednesday. You
will need the emailed
meeting id and
password to join.

Wed PM Bible Study
7:00pm - 8:00pm

29

Sun AM Bible Study
9:15am - 10:05am

Sun AM Worship
10:15am - 11:45am

Services Cancelled
12:30pm - 3:25pm
Due to the
recommendations
from the CDC and the
city of Chattanooga to
prevent the spread of
coronavirus and to
protect our members
services for the
foreseeable future
have been cancelled.
As soon as possible
we will resume
worship services.
Please check back
prior to services to
verify if services have
been cancelled or not.
If you are in doubt
please submit a
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question. Please join
us for a Bible Moment
on our Facebook page
beginning at 10:15am
on Sundays and 7pm
on Wednesdays. You
can also join us for a
Bible Study on Zoom
at 9:30am on Sunday
and around 7:30pm
on Wednesday. You
will need the emailed
meeting id and
password to join.
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